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January 28, 2016 
 

28th CIMAC World Congress in Helsinki, 
Finland 
 

The 28th CIMAC World Congress is one of the most important international events in the field of 
Large Diesel and Gas Engines and will take place from 6 - 10 June 2016 in Helsinki, Finland. 

For a grand week the engine industry will be in Helsinki to review and discuss technical, environmental 
and regulatory trends, developments, opportunities and challenges. More than 1,000 experts of the large 
engines industry including engineers, developers, professors and scientists, ship owners, power station 
and rail operators, oil companies and suppliers from all over the world will be present at the event.  

A traditional value of the CIMAC Congress has always been the high technical level of the sessions and 
this year is no exception. The five-day Congress will offer state-of-the-art information on engine 
technology and engine applications by specialists working in relevant fields. The CIMAC Congress will 
also feature an exhibition floor where companies and institutes can present their latest technologies and 
products, along with social evenings and technical visits which will aim to bring together the fraternity a 
step closer than ever before.  

High-Quality Technical Programme 

The Congress will encompass all technological aspects of the large engines industry from across the 
globe and is a unique gathering of an assembly of key decision makers who only meet once every three 
years to spend a week of undivided attention on the latest and the greatest the industry has to offer.  

The high-quality technical papers to be presented will be in resonance with CIMAC’s goal of addressing 
the newest technologies and the development trends focusing on all aspects of the energy conversion 
process as well as the user’s experience with engines and plants in operation. Some of the important 
areas to be addressed at the event include Product Development with Diesel, Gas and Dual Fuel 
Engines, Emissions Control and Exhaust Gas Aftertreatment, Turbochargers & Air/Exhaust Management, 
System Integration & Optimization as well as Users’ Aspects, Maintenance & Monitoring for various 
applications among others.  

As the Congress aims to address the current inclinations of the industry, more new and broader 
challenges awaits us in the future. And to this regard one of the most interesting topics that will be 
discoursed during the event is the area of System Integration. The underlying fundamental question is 
how to increase the overall efficiency and performance of ships and other large engine applications 
through a holistic approach, which takes into account the entire powertrain and focuses on 
comprehensive system engineering solutions. 

Building on the success from the previous Congress held in Shanghai in 2013, CIMAC hopes that this 
year at Helsinki will mark a turning point in the way the large engines industry is being viewed not just as 
a ‘Manufacturer- End User’ commercial function but also from the value they bring to the customer from a 
standpoint of environmentally and economically sustainable energy production.   

Come, join us at Helsinki!       
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About CIMAC 

Originally founded in Paris in 1951, CIMAC is the leading global association of the internal combustion 
machinery industry. It is a non-profit association bringing together and representing the large engines 
industry to regulators and standardizing bodies. In addition to promoting the work of National Member 
Associations, CIMAC supports and facilitates information exchange and understanding across the global 
community involved in the development and sustenance of large engines. 

For further information about CIMAC please contact CIMAC Central Secretariat at info@cimac.com  

Or visit the CIMAC website at www.cimac.com.  

For information about the CIMAC Congress 2016 please visit www.cimaccongress.com. 

CIMAC Central Secretariat 

c/o VDMA e.V. 

Lyoner Str. 18 

D-60528 Frankfurt / Main 

Germany 

Phone: +49 69 6603 1355 

E-mail: info@cimac.com 


